.pdf
Importance: Hig

Hi Tracy & Barbara,

Please see attached for a proposed contract with CorVel Enterprise Claims for RFP 2026.0069

Worker’'s Compensation and Heart & Hypertension Claims Administration for the Board of
Finance and Board of Representatives’ consideration/approval in January.

Thank you,
Lauren

Lauren Meyer

Special Assistant to Mayor Simmons
Director of Legislative Affairs
Imeyer@stamfordct.gov
203-977-5115

203-921-8397 (cell)

From: Turner, Elizabeth <ETurner@StamfordCT.gov>

Sent: Monday, December 29, 2025 11:41 AM

To: Simmons, Caroline <CSimmons@StamfordCT.gov>

Cc: Meyer, Lauren <LMeyer@StamfordCT.gov>; Levy, Linda <LLevy@StamfordCT.gov>; Nguyen,
Ngan <NNguyen@StamfordCT.gov>; Villalva, David <DVillalva@StamfordCT.gov>; Larson, Erik
<ElLarson@StamfordCT.gov>; Bottoni, Kristopher <KBottoni@StamfordCT.gov>; Dignoti, James
<JDignoti@StamfordCT.gov>; Rosenson, Valerie <VRosensonl@StamfordCT.gov>

Subject: FW: City of Stamford - CorVel - Contract for Worker’s Compensation and Heart &
Hypertension Claims Administration (RFP 2026.0069)

Importance: High

Good morning Your Honor,

Attached is a fully executed contract with CorVel Enterprise Claims for RFP 2026.0069
Worker's Compensation and Heart & Hypertension Claims Administration. If agreeable,

please forward these Contract Documents to the City’s Board of Finance and Board



of Representatives for consideration on their January 2026, agenda.

These contract services will begin on January 1, 2026, and terminate three (3) years thereafter.
The yearly fee for this service is Three Hundred twenty-Six Thousand Seven Hundred Forty
($326,740.00) Dollars. However, this contract has a $99,000.00 cap on fees without an
additional notice to proceed from the City, which notice to proceed is subject to Board
approvals. This allows CorVel to continue these necessary services while we seek approvals
for payment over $100,000.00.

Please note that due to its size Exhibit B may be found at this link: _

I

Please contact David Villalva the City’s Risk Manager if you have any specific questions about
these services. You may, of course contact me at your convenience if | may be of any further
assistance to you in this matter.

Thank you,

Elizabeth (Liz) C. Turner
Assistant Corporation Counsel

City of Stamford

888 Washington Boulevard, 9th Floor
Stamford CT 06901

Tel: 203.977.5726

Fax: 203.977.5560

From: Turner, Elizabeth

Sent: Friday, December 26, 2025 1:58 PM

To: Simmons, Caroline <CSimmons@StamfordCT.gov>

Cc: Villalva, David <DVillalva@StamfordCT.gov>; Larson, Erik <ELarson@StamfordCT.gov>; Bottoni,
Kristopher <KBottoni@StamfordCT.gov>; Dignoti, James <JDignoti@StamfordCT.gov>; Rosenson,
Valerie <VRosensonl@StamfordCT.gov>; Nguyen, Ngan <NNguyen@StamfordCT.gov>; Meyer,
Lauren < Mever@StamfordCT.gov>; Levy, Linda <LLevy@StamfordCT.gov>

Subject: City of Stamford - CorVel - Contract for Worker’s Compensation and Heart & Hypertension
Claims Administration (RFP 2026.0069)

Importance: High

Good afternoon Your Honor,

Attached is a proposed Contract CorVel Enterprise Claims for RFP 2026.0069 Worker’s



Compensation and Heart & Hypertension Claims Administration. If agreeable, please print
the signature page in color, sign/date in blue before two witnesses, scan itin color
and email it back to me for further processing.

CorVel will provide worker’s compensation services in the following areas: claims
administration services, medical management through the utilization of a preferred provider
organization and administration of heart and hypertension for the City’s Police Department and
Fire Department. These services will commence on January 1, 2026, and terminate three (3)
years thereafter. The parties may, by mutual agreement, extend the Term of this Agreement for
two (2) additional years provided that all other terms of this Agreement remain the same. No
such extension shall be for greater than one (1) year and, under no circumstances, shall the
entire Term of this Agreement, including any extension years, exceed five (5) years.

The fees for these services will be paid yearly as outlined in the Compensation section of the
Contract (paragraph 3) and in CorVel’s Price Proposal attached thereto as Exhibit C. The yearly
rate for the first year of services is Three Hundred twenty-Six Thousand Seven Hundred Forty
($326,740.00) Dollars.

However, this Contract has a $99,000.00 cap on fees without an additional notice to proceed
from the City, which notice to proceed is subject to Board approvals. This allows CorVel to
continue these necessary services while we seek Board approvals for payment over
$100,000.00. | will, therefore, forward the full set of fully executed Contract documents back
to you with instructions to submit them to the Board of Finance and Board of Representatives
for approval.

Please note that due to its size — Exhibit B may be found here: _

Please contact David Villalva the City’s Risk Manager if you have any specific questions about
these services. You may, of course contact me at your convenience if | may be of any further
assistance to you in this matter.

Thank you.

Elizabeth (Liz) C. Turner
Assistant Corporation Counsel

City of Stamford

888 Washington Boulevard, 9th Floor



Stamford CT 06901
Tel: 203.977.5726
Fax: 203.977.5560





